
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



1 

Dear Staff Members, 

As a part of Quality up gradation of the institution, kindly fill in the following format 

S.NO. 

based on the scales given. 

A score of one is low and score of five is high. NA - Not Applicable 

2 

3 

4 

AUXILIUM COLLEGE (Autonomous), Vellore 

5 

STAFF FEED BACK ON CURRICULUM DEVELOPMENT 

6 

7 

10 

STATEMENT 

The key concepts addressed in the course are met. 

Students acquire the necessary skill set, on the 
completion of their course. 

Curriculum is updated at periodic intervals. 

There is sufficient time to complete the syllabus. 

Examinations are conducted on the basis of the 
curriculum. 

Assessments enable the students adequately to 
demonstrate their learning through higher order 

thinking. 
Curriculum addresses the learning needs of all the 

students. 

Sufficient books are maintained in the library as 
per the curriculum 

Skill based papers are relevant to the industrial 

requirements. 

I am happy and satisfied with the overall 
curriculum of the institution. 

1 3 4 NA 

(Dr. h.SoTATHA) 
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Dear Staff Members. 

As a part of Quality up gradation of the institution, kindly fill in the following format 
based on the scales given. 

S.NO. 

3 

A seore of one is low and score of five is high. NA  Not Applicable 

4 

AUXILIUM COLLEGE (Autonomous), Vellore 

5 

STAFF FEED BACK ON CURRICULUM DEVELOPMENT 

6 

7 

10 

STATEMENT 

The key concepts addressed in the course are met. 

Students acquire the necessary skill set, on the 
completion of their course. 

Curriculum is updated at periodic intervals. 

There is sufficient time to complete the syllabus. 
Examinations are conducted on the basis of the 
curriculum. 

Assessments enable the students adequately to 
demonstrate their learning through higher order 
thinking. 
Curriculum addresses the learning needs of all the 
students. 

Sufficient books are maintained in the library as 
per the curriculum 

Skill based papers are relevant to the industrial 
requirements. 

I am happy and satisfied with the overall 
curriculum of the institution. 

s. LAvANya ) 

1 2 3 4 NA 
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Dear Staff Members, 

based on the scales given. 

S.NO. 

A score of one is low and score of five is high. NA Not Applicable 

2 

3 

4 

AUXILIUM COLLEGE (Autonomous), Vellore 
STAFF FEED BACK ON CURRICULUM DEVELOPMENT 

As a part of Quality up gradation of the institution, kindly fill in the following format 

6 

8 

10 

STATEMENT 

The key concepts addressed in the course are met. 

Students acquire the necessary skill set, on the 
completion of their course. 

Curriculum is updated at periodic intervals. 

There is sufficient time to complete the syllabus. 

Examinations are conducted on the basis of the 
curriculum. 

Assessments enable the students adequately to 
demonstrate their learning through higher order 
thinking. 
Curriculum addresses the learning needs of all the 
students. 

Sufficient books are maintained in the library as 
per the curriculum 

Skill based papers are relevant to the industrial 
requirements. 

I am happy and satisfied with the overall 
curriculum of the institution. 

1 2 3 4 NA 

Ass. stont pojesot 
Doparnent Cornere (clit 

ye lore -b 
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Dear Stat Members, 

As a part of Quality up gradation of the institution. kindly fill in the following format 

S.NO. 

based on the scales given. 

A score of one is low and score of five is high. NA - Not Applicable 

3 

4 

AUXILIUM COLLEGE (Autonomous), Vellore 

6 

STAFF FEED BACK ON CURRICULUM DEVELOPMENT 

7 

8 

10 

STATEMENT 

The key concepts addressed in the course are met. 

Students acquire the necessary skill set, on the 
completion of their course. 

Curriculum is updated at periodic intervals. 

There is sufficient time to complete the syllabus. 

Examinations are conducted on the basis of the 
curriculum. 

Assessments enable the students adequately to 
demonstrate their learning through higher order 
thinking. 
Curriculum addresses the learning needs of all the 
students. 

Sufficient books are maintained in the library as 
per the curriculum 

Skill based papers are relevant to the industrial 
requirements. 

I am happy and satisfied with the overall 
curriculum of the institution. 

3 5 NA 

ABI BCALA H.G 
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Dear Staff Members, 

S.NO. 

As a part of Quality up gradation of the institution, kindly fill in the following format 
based on the scales given. 

2 

4 

6 

7 

AUXILIUM COLLEGE (Autonomous), Vellore 

8 

STAFF FEED BACK ON CURRICULUM DEVELOPMENT 

10 

A score of one is low and score of five is high. NA  Not Applicable 

STATEMENT 

The key concepts addressed in the course are met. 

Students acquire the necessary skill set, on the 
completion of their course. 

Curriculum is updated at periodic intervals. 

There is sufficient time to complete the syllabus. 

Examinations are conducted on the basis of the 
curriculum. 

Assessments enable the students adequately to 
demonstrate their learning through higher order 
thinking, 
Curriculum addresses the learning needs of all the 
students. 

Sufficient books are maintained in the library as 
per the curriculum 

Skill based papers are relevant to the industrial 
requirements. 

I am happy and satisfied with the overall 
curriculum of the institution. 

2 4 NA 
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